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Manager's Introduction

Here at Dalgety Bay, we have had an amazing summer so far. When the weather
has been nice we’ve utilised the garden, taking advantage of the great space we
have for the residents to enjoy. 

There’s been plenty of things going on both outside and in, we look forward to more
sunshine, BBQs and quality time with family and friends.

Also, if you know someone who would like to receive our email newsletters/updates
just let us know, or forward them the newsletter sign up link below:

Newsletter Sign-Up

Best wishes,

Tabatha Jacome
Home Manager
 

You Are Invited!

GladtoCare Week

In May we celebrated Glad to Care week showing love and thanks for everyone in
the care industry. Our residents enjoyed delicious cakes and some craft sessions.
There was time for a bit of pampering for the ladies and for the gents to catch up
over a pint and a card game or two!

Recent Activities

Our residents have tried all kinds of activities in the past few months...

We celebrated Wimbledon with quizzes and strawberries and cream, made
suncatchers for the summer solstice and enjoyed flower arranging to brighten up the
dining rooms. There were lots of time for drawing and crafting along with D-Day
celebrations in the Café.

We also had an amazing afternoon at a local football match thanks to The Swifts
who made everyone feel so welcome, despite the rain!

Gala Day

Our Care Home is on the Gala Day procession route, and this was our first
experience of a Gala Day since opening in November. We thought it would be a
lovely opportunity to involve the residents with the community they are part of.

On the day of the Gala, we decorated the home with bunting and we made and
decorated flags for the parade.

We all sat together outside waving our flags and watched the parade pass by. There
were hundreds of people and local community groups. Everyone gave the residents
a wave as they passed. The Gala organisers stopped the parade and the Pipe Band
gathered in front of us and played just for the residents.

It was a lovely experience, and the residents were amazed how many people they
saw and waved to!

Relaxing In The Garden

We welcomed residents, family and friends to our first Barbecue of the summer.
There was plenty of chat and laughter as we sat in the sunshine together enjoying
delicious food prepared by our chef. We hope to host many more in the future!

The summer weather hasn’t been great this year, but we’ve tried to take full
advantage of the sunny days we have had. Our residents love to sit out in the sun,
whether it’s reading, playing games such as pitch ‘n’ putt, and bowling or just a little
bit of tidying up in the garden!

Appreciating Our Team

Here at Dalgety Bay we love to recognise our staff and the hard work they do.
Kindness and Passion have been recognised recently for Argentina, Sarah, Sarah,
Catherine and Karen. Well done, your hard work and dedication does not go
unnoticed!

Social Media

Make sure to check out the Dalgety Bay Care Home Facebook Page.
 

Don't Forget To 'Like' Us!
 

Leave A Review

We would be very grateful if you could spare a few minutes to write a review for us:
 

Carehome.co.uk Reviews
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